

**SHERIFF SALE TAX FORECLOSURE LIST
TUESDAY, AUGUST 22, 2023 AT 1:30 P.M.
MAHONING COUNTY COMMISSIONERS' HEARING ROOM**

1. 19CV1717 DANIEL R YEMMA VS ABRAHAM TORRESS DECD ET AL	863 PASADENA AVE YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44502 53-113-0-262.00-0	\$10,863.62 PLUS COSTS \$12,500.00 LEVONSR1 LLC
2. 22CV0219 DANIEL R YEMMA VS GARY CARSON ET AL	S. EAST RIVER RD LOT 356 & 357 HYDE LOT 355, 354, 353, 352, 351, 350, 349, 348, & 347 LAKE SHORE DEVELOPMENT (VACANT LOTS) BERLIN CENTER, OH 44401 51-062-0-001.00-0, 51-062-0-002.00-0, 51-062-0-003.00-0, 51-062-0-004.00-0, 51-062-0-005.00-0, 51-062-0-006.00-0, 51-062-0-007.00-0, 51-062-0-008.00-0, 51-062-0-009.00-0, 51-062-0-010.00-0, & 51-062-0-011.00-0	\$4,981.82 PLUS COSTS WYLDER REAL ESTATE ASSOCIATION
3. 22CV1386 DANIEL R YEMMA VS ALBERT STREET DEVELOPMENT INC. ET AL	1422 ALBERT STREET LOT 61801 (VACANT LOT) ALBERT STREET LOT 61800 (VACANT LOT) YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44505 53-103-0-002.04-0 & 53-103-0-002.05-0	\$9,426.13 PLUS COSTS NO BID
4. 22CV1527 DANIEL R YEMMA VS WILLIAM ROGAN DECD ET AL	413 W. WARREN AVE YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44511 53-057-0-185.00-0	\$8,865.39 PLUS COSTS NO BID
5. 22CV1626 DANIEL R YEMMA VS SHEILA WILLIAMS DECD ET AL	741 SHERWOOD AVE YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44511 53-130-0-383.00-0	\$7,800.11 PLUS COSTS \$16,000.00 YOUNGSTOWN NEIGHBORHOOD DEVELOPMENT CORP
6. 22CV2028 DANIEL R YEMMA VS B.R.A.N. GENERAL CONTRACTORS INC	1918 S. RACCOON RD AUSTINTOWN, OH 44515 48-070-0-007.00-0	\$23,741.17 PLUS COSTS TAAM PROPERTIES
7. 22CV2060 DANIEL R YEMMA VS HAROLD SMITH ET AL	1019 EDWARDS ST. YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44502 53-054-0-412.00-0	\$6,598.47 PLUS COSTS NO BID
8. 23CV0035 DANIEL R YEMMA VS WADE OVERLIE ET AL	727 WILKINSON AVE LOT 62922 (VACANT LOT) YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44509 53-141-0-045.00-0	\$8,129.56 PLUS COSTS NO BID
9. 23CV0107 DANIEL R YEMMA VS KENNY REYES ET AL	40 E. MARION AVE YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44507 53-047-0-217.00-0	\$5,503.51 PLUS COSTS NO BID

**NEXT AVAILABLE SHERIFF SALE LIST: TUESDAY, AUGUST 29, 2023
NEXT SHERIFF SALE: TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 5, 2023**