

**SHERIFF SALE TAX FORECLOSURE LIST
TUESDAY, MARCH 28, 2023 1:30 P.M.
MAHONING COUNTY COMMISSIONERS' HEARING ROOM**

1. 18CV0745 DANIEL R YEMMA VS TWH OF OHIO, LLC ET AL	4012 SUNSET DR BOARDMAN, OH 44512 29-011-0-011.00-0	\$17,375.45 PLUS COSTS \$52,000.00
UNITED HOMES CONSTRUCTION		
2. 21CV0911 DANIEL R YEMMA VS ROSEMARIE ANTONNOFF DECD ET AL	2990 WHISPERING PINES DR CANFIELD, OH 44406 48-103-0-029.00-0	\$37,563.07 PLUS COSTS \$175,000.00
M. WALKER INVESTMENTS LLC		
3. 22CV0144 DANIEL R YEMMA VS DOROTHY TALAGANIS ET AL	58 W. LIBERTY ST & W. LIBERTY (VACANT LOT) LOWELLVILLE, OH 44436 40-009-0-194.00-0 & 40-009-0-194.01-0	\$3,281.69 PLUS COSTS NO BID
4. 22CV0312 DANIEL R YEMMA VS WALTER WOODS DECD ET AL	483 MISTLETOE AVE LOT YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44511 53-125-0-083.00-0	\$3,577.10 PLUS COSTS \$47,000.00
ELIAS ALEXANDER III		
5. 22CV0587 DANIEL R YEMMA VS DAVID ANDERSON ET AL	146 OREGON AVE LOT 76 SEBRING, OH 44672 21-003-0-085.00-0	\$20,179.46 PLUS COSTS NO BID
6. 22CV0856 DANIEL R YEMMA VS STEVEN GUILDOO ET AL	120 E TEXAS AVE SEBRING, OH 44672 21-002-0-210.00-0	\$10,268.53 PLUS COSTS NO BID
7. 22CV0874 DANIEL R YEMMA VS MONTY MARTIN DECD ET AL	1961 RIDGELAWN AVE YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44509 53-162-0-085.00-0	\$11,120.53 PLUS COSTS \$30,100.00
THAKUR CONTRACTOR LLC		
8. 22CV1152 DANIEL R YEMMA VS EDWARD KLEIN DECD ET AL	ELMWOOD AVE LOT 429-A (VACANT LOT) AUSTINTOWN, OH 44515 48-009-0-093.00-0	\$2,769.88 PLUS COSTS NO BID
9. 22CV1339 DANIEL R YEMMA VS STEEL PROPERTIES LLC ET AL	17692 LAUREL AVE LOT 584 (VACANT LOT) LAKE MILTON, OH 44429 33-029-0-245.00-0	\$4,375.52 PLUS COSTS NO BID
10. 22CV1383 DANIEL R YEMMA VS NORTH ROYALTON FOODS INC ET AL	ALBERT ST LOT 61869 YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44505 53-101-0-002.01-0	\$8,900.00 PLUS COSTS NO BID
11. 22CV1475 DANIEL R YEMMA VS JASON KOVAL ET AL	PROSPECT ST LOT 1240 & 1241 (VACANT LOTS) McCLURE ST LOT 1188 & 1189 (VACANT LOTS) STRUTHERS, OH 44471 38-010-0-175.00-0, 38-010-0-176.00-0, 38-010-0-177.00-0, & 38-010-0-178.00-0	\$5,972.38 PLUS COSTS NO BID

**NEXT AVAILABLE SHERIFF SALE LIST: TUESDAY, APRIL 4, 2023
NEXT SHERIFF SALE: TUESDAY, APRIL 11, 2023**